CITY OF SALEM
COMMON COUNCIL REGULAR MEETING MINUTES
JULY 19, 2021
6:30 PM

OPENING 6:30 PM
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE: Council President Earl Gage
INVOCATION: Council President Earl Gage

STATEMENT OF ADVERTISEMENT:

The City Clerk read the following: Notice of this meeting has been provided to the South Jersey Times and the
Elmer Times and is posted on the City Hall Bulletin Board stating the time and the place of the meeting. Notice
has also been posted that the meeting can be accessed through Zoom.

ROLL CALL:
Present: Cline, Davis, Gregory, Groce, Kellum, Slaughter, Smith, Gage
Also Present: Mayor Washington, Solicitor Rhea, CFO Nunez, AND Commerce Director Bailey

APPROVAL OF MINUTES:
1-1-2021, 1-11-2021, 1-19-2021, 2-8-2021 and 2-8-2021 Executive session
Motion to Approve: Gregory Second: Kellum All Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.

APPROVAL OF BILLS:
Motion: Gregory and Second Kellum
All Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.

PUBLIC PORTION FOR AGENDA ITEMS ONLY:
Motion to open: Gregory and Second: Kellum
All Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.

Mr. Angeli stated the following: The public is instructed that this portion of the meeting is provided for
comments and questions on Agenda items only. There will be a public portion later in the meeting for
general comments and questions. Please state your name and address, street name only for the record.

No comments or questions were offered.

Motion to close the public portion on agenda items: Gregory and Second: Kellum
All Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.

COMMUNICATIONS/APPLICATIONS/REPORTS:

Approval of an entertainment license for Salem County Inter Agency Council of Human Services for a Human
Resources Fair on August 11, 2021 (rain date 8-18-2021) at MLK Park

Motion to Approve: Gregory Second: Kellum All Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.

SECOND READING OF AND HEARINGS FOR ORDINANCES:
ORD. 2106 AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 225, SECTION 37 HANDICAPPED

PARKING ZONE, AUTHORIZING A HANDICAPPED PARKING SIGN TO BE
PLACED AT 323 NEW MARKET STREET




Motion to open the public hearing on ORD. 2106: Gregory Second: Kellum Voice Vote: 8-0
There were no questions or comments from the public or Council members on Ord. 2106
Motion to close the public hearing on ORD. 2106: Gregory Second: Kellum Voice Vote: 8-0
Motion to adopt ORD 2106: Gregory Second: Kellum RCV: 8-0

INTRODUCTION OF ORDINANCES FOR FIRST READING:

This is the first reading and introduction. The public hearing for ordinance 2108 will be on August 16, 2021 at
6:30PM

ORD. 2108 AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 130 SECTION 35 LAND USE
APPLICATION AND ESCROW FEES
Motion to Introduce: Gregory Second: Kellum All Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.

INTRODUCTION OF RESOLUTIONS FOR CONSIDERATION:

RES. 2021-153 RESOLUTION AWARDING CONTRACT/PURCHASE ORDER(S) TO PITNEY
BOWES LEASE OF SENDPROAUTO STAMP METER MODEL SendPro C Auto
Motion to Introduce: Gregory Second: Kellum All Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.

RES. 2021-154 AUTHORIZING REFUND OF A WATER AND SEWER OVERPAYMENT UPON
CLOSING/SETTLEMENT TRANSACTION
Motion to Introduce: Gregory Second: Kellum All Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.

RES. 2021-155 A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE REJECTION OF BIDS FOR FY2021
NJDOT TRUST FUND RECONSTRUCTION OF 8™ STREET - PHASE 2
Motion to Introduce: Gregory Second: Kellum All Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.

RES. 2021-156 A RESOLUTION PROVIDING FOR A MEETING NOT OPEN TO THE
PUBLIC IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE PROVISIONS OF THE NEW
JERSEY OPEN PUBLIC MEETINGS ACT, NJSA 10:4-12 These items are for
(4) Matters pertaining to a collective bargaining agreement
Motion to Introduce: Gregory Second: Kellum All Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.

RES. 2021-157 A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE PART TIME EMPLOYMENT OF A
CONFIDENTIAL SECRETARY TO THE CHIEF OF POLICE
Motion to Introduce: Gregory Second: Kellum Al Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.

RES. 2021-158 A RESOLUTION APPROVING NOTICE AND REQUEST FOR
QUALIFICATIONS RELATING TO THE SALE OF THE WATER AND
WASTEWATER SYSTEMS OF THE CITY OF SALEM

Motion to Introduce: Gregory Second: Kellum All Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.

RES. 2021-159 RESOLUTION EXPRESSING THE CITY COUNCIL’S SUPPORT FOR NEW
FRONTIER SOLUTIONS, LLC’S OPERATION OF A MEDICAL CANNABIS
RETAIL ESTABLISHMENT WITHIN SALEM CITY

Motion to Introduce: Gregory Second: Kellum All Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.

RES. 2021-160 RESOLUTION TERMINATING AGREEMENT FOR VOLUNTEER
AMBULANCE SERVICES WITH FENWICK COMMUNITY AMBULANCE, INC.
Motion to Introduce: Gregory Second: Kellum All Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.




COMMITTEE REPORTS:

ADMINISTRATION (Gage, Gregory, Kellum, Smith)

PUBLIC SAFETY (Gage, Smith, Groce, Davis)

PUBLIC WORKS (Groce, Gregory, Gage, Slaughter)

ORDINANCE/BUILDINGS AND GROUNDS (Cline, Slaughter, Smith, Groce)
NEIGHBORHOOD INITIATIVES/PARKS AND RECS (Slaughter, Kellum, Cline, Davis)
ECONOMIC AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT (Davis, Smith, Gregory, Kellum)

MAYORAL COMMENTS:
No comments

COMMERCE, DIRECTOR REPORT:
OLD BUSINESS: None
NEW BUSINESS: None

PUBLIC PORTION:
Motion to open: Gregory and Second: Kellum
All Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.

Mr. Angeli stated the following: The public is instructed that this portion of the meeting is provided for
comments and questions on any matter. Please state your name and address, street name only for the record.

Rod Miller, Newcastle, asked about a property on west Broadway that was running a garage. Mr. Angeli
stated that Code enforcement was keeping an eye on the situation.

Motion to close the public portion on agenda items: Gregory and Second: Kellum All Council Members present
voted in favor in a voice vote.

ADJOURNMENT:

Motion: Gregory and Second: Kellum
All Council Members present voted in favor in a voice vote.

Minutes respectfully submitted by:

Ben Angeli, RMC

NEXT COUNCII MEETING: AUGUST 9, 2021 AT 6:30 PM




CITY OF SALEM
ORDINANCE NO. 2106

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 225, SECTION 37 HANDICAPPED
PARKING ZONE, AUTHORIZING A HANDICAPPED PARKING
SIGN TO BE PLACED AT 323 NEW MARKET STREET

BE IT ORDAINDED by the Common Council of the City of Salem that Chapter 225, Section 17,
Schedule “11” be amended as follows:

A Handicapped Parking Sign shall be placed at 323 New Market Street, the residence of Sakia Atwell.

A CITY OF SALEM
Ben Angeli, RMC ‘ Earl Gage, C%cﬂ President

Introduced: June 21, 2021

COUNCIL MOVED SECONDED N | ABSTAIN ABSENT
S. Cline
R. Davis
T. Gregory X
V. Groce
S. Kellum X
G. Slaughter
J. Smith

E. Gage
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I, Ben Angeli, City Clerk of the City of Salem, in the County of Salem, do hereby certify the foregoing to be
a true and correct copy of an Ordinance introduced by the Common Council of the City of Salem on June 21,

2021, Public Hearing shall take place on July 19, 2021.
Cor -2y R ﬂ/

Date Ben Angeli, TRMC

COUNCIL MOVED SECONDED N ABSTAIN ABSENT
S. Cline
R. Davis
T. Gregory X
V. Groce
S. Kellum X
(. Slanghter
J. Smith

E. Gage
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Date Charles Washington Jr, Mayor

I, Ben Angeli, Municipal Clerk of the City of Salem, in the County of Salem, do hereby certify the foregoing
to be a true and correct copy of an Ordinance adopted by the Common Council of the City of Salem after a
second reading and public hearing on July 19, 2021.

7 47
Date Ben Angehf’RMé s




CITY OF SALEM
ORDINANCE NO. 2108

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 130 SECTION 35 LAND USE
APPLICATION AND ESCROW FEES

WHEREAS, the Common Council of the City of Salem has undergone a review of its ordinances
establishing fees for application and services rendered by the Planning Board and seeks to amend fees set
forth in Chapter 130-35 of the City Code.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED by the Common Council of the City of Salem, in the County of
Salem and State of New Jersey that Section 35 of Chapter 130 of the Municipal Code, Land Use be amended
as follows: ‘

§130-35 A and B entitled “Fees” is hereby amended to read as follows:

A. The following fees shall be charged an applicant for review of an application by the Planning Board:

Every application for development shall be accompanied by Check(s) payable to City of Salem in accordance with the
following schedule of Administrative Escrow Fees. Administrative Fees and Escrow Fees shall be paid in separate

checks.
Administrative Escrow Deposits
Fees
1. Informal Review
a. One (1) fifteen (i5) minute appearance $100 $300
b. Any additional appearance $200 3750
2. Subdivisions
a. Miner Subdivision Plat 5100 $1000
b. Prefiminary Major Subdivision Plat $500 $500 plus $150 per lot.
Minimum deposit shall be
$2000
C. Final Major Subdivision Plat
$500 $250 plus $75 per lot.
Minimum deposit shall be
d. Amended: Minor, Preliminary Major and/or] $1000
Final Major Subdivision Plat
$200 $1000
e. Request for Re-approval or Extension of Time
$300 $300 plus $25 per lot.
Minimum deposit shall be
$500




Site Plans

a,

d.

Minor

Preliminary Major Site Plan

Final Major Site Plan

Amended Minor, Preliminary Major and/or

Final Major Site Plan

a.

Reguest for Re-approval or Extension of Time

$200

$300

5200

$200

5300

$2000

$500/acre or part thereof,
plus $50 per dwelling unit in
the case of multiple family u
nits and/or $0.10/gross sq.
ft. of building area in the
case of non-residential
buiidings, provided a
minimum $4000 shall he
depasited.

$250/acre or part thereof,
plus $25 per unit in the case
of multipie-family units
and/or 50.05/gross sq. ft. of
building area in the case of
non-residential buildings,
provided a minimum $2000
shall he depasited.

$1000

$300 plus $100 per acre or
part thereof

f.  Conditional uses (In addition to fees for Required Site

Plan or Subdivision Review

$300

$100 per acre or part
thereof, Minimum deposit
is $1000

Variances

Use and Others {NJSA 40:55D-70d)

Conditional U se and Bulk (NJSA 40:55D-70c}

Hardship {NJSA 40:55D-70c)
Appeals and Interpretations

Permit {NJSA 40:55D-34 & 35)

$300

$300

$300
$300

$300

$2000

$300 first variance plus $200
each additional variance

$500
$1000

$1000

Site Plan Waivers

$200

$500

Application and Escrow Fees (Amended 3-6-1996 by Ord. No. 96-2)

1.

The application fees and escrow fees received hereinabove are minimums which must
accompany the application. An application shall not be deemed complete until the application
fee and escrow fee required have been paid. The Planning Board shall exercise its discretion in




establishing the figure required for the escrow fund in the event that the project will require more
time for review than has been provided for by the figures received hereinabove or the project is of
a nature that is not expressly included in one of the aforementioned categories.

2. Application fees and escrow fees must be submitted in separate checks payable to Salem City.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that all ordinances or parts of ordinances of the City of Salem heretofore
adopted that are inconsistent with any of the terms and provisions of this Ordinance are hereby repealed to
the extent of any inconsistency.

" BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this ordinance shall take effect after adoption and publication in
accordance with law.

ATTEST: CITY OF SALEM

Ben Angeli, RMC Earl Gage, Council President

COUNCIL | MOVED | SECONDED| Y N | ABSTAIN | ABSENT
S. Cline
R. Davis
T. Gregory
V. Groce
S. Kellum
G. Slaughter
J. Smith
E. Gage

I, Ben Angeli, City Clerk of the City of Salem, in the County of Salem, do hereby certify the foregoing to be
a true and correct copy of an Ordinance introduced by the Common Council of the City of Salem on July 19,
2021. Public Hearing shall take place on August 16, 2021.

Date Ben Angeli, RMC




CITY OF SALEM
RESOLUTION 2021-153

RESOLUTION AWARDING CONTRACT/PURCHASE ORDER(S) TO PITNEY
BOWES LEASE OF SENDPROAUTO STAMP METER MODEL SendPro C Auto

WHEREAS, the Salem City Municipal Court needs to replace its stamp postage meter equipment;

WHEREAS the current stamp meter is outdated and the parts and maintenance routine will no longer
be available by the end of the year; and

WHEREAS, Pitney Bowes 3001 Summer St, Stamford, CT 06926 awarded State Contract Number
A41258 under Mailroom Equipment and Maintenance; and

WHEREAS, in accordance with the authority set forth in N.J.S.A. 40A:11-12 of the Local Public
Contracts Law, public bidding is not required when the purchase is under a state contract; and

_ WHEREAS, the total amount of this lease contract for the SendPro C Auto, does not exceed
-$8600.00 143.33 per month over 60 months or $429.99 per quarter over five year contract; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:30-11.10 funds for Open-End Contracts shall be committed at the
time the order is placed and shall not exceed the unit price; and

WHEREAS, the certification of available funds shall be made by the Chief Financial Officer, as
appropriate (N.J.A.C. 5:30-5.5(b)); and

WHEREAS, the Common Council of City of Salem accepts recommendations as described herein.
NOW, THEREFORE, IT IS RESOLVED by the Common Council of the City of Salem, as follows:

1. The Mayor is hereby authorized to execute a contract/purchase order(s) in the amount not to exceed
$8600.

2. This contract is authorized pursuant to the authority set forth in N.J.S.A. 40A:11-12 of the Local Public
Contracts Law, and State Contract, No. A41258.
ATTEST: CITY OF SALEM

A 74 L,

Charles Bailey, Deputy Municipal Clerk Earl Gage, Council Pfésidnt

COUNCIL MOVED SECONDED N | ABSTAIN ABSENT

S. Cline
R. Davis
T. Gregory X
V. Groce
S. Kellum X
G. Slaughter
J. Smith

E. Gage
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I, Charles Bailey, Deputy Municipal Clerk of the City of Salem, in the County of Salem, do hereby certify the
foregoing to be a true and correct copy of a Resolution adopted by the Common Council of the City of Salem on

July 19, 2021.
0y7/ RO[202/ W A

Date Charles Bailey, De/puty Municipal Clerk
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Sourcewell (formerly known 2s NJPA) State & Local FMV Lease

i dead

Agresmant Number

Your Business Information

Full Legal Name of Lessee TOEA Name of Lessse

CITY OF SALEM GOURT

Tax I # (FERUTIN)

SoldTe; Address

125 W BROADWAY, SALENM, K, 0B0768-1323, us

) Sold-To: Contact Name

Tiema Jannings

SoldTa; Contact Phone #
(as6) 8351734

Sold-Ta: Account #
0011882278

Bill-To: Address

125 W HROADWAY, SALEM, NI, 08079-1323, US

Blll-To; Contact Name

Tierra Jennings

BWi<To; Contact Phone #
(856) 835-1734

BEll-Ta: Account #
(011882279

Bi-Ta; Emall
fiema. jennings@njcourts.pov

Ship-To: Address

125 W BROADWAY, SALEM, N.J, 080781323, US

" Ship-Ta: Contact Name

' Tlgﬁ'a Jennings

Ship-Ta: Contact Phone #
{BSE) BA5-1734

Ship-Ta: Account #
sb1iez2278

PO#

Your Business Needs

Qfy Hem Business Solufion Description
1 SENDFROCALITO
SendPro C Auto
1 1FXA
interéace fo InView Deshboard
1 lal¢]
™ C Series IM] Mater
d B83-4B
DBM40DC Retum Kit - Upgrade to 8H0D
1 APAC
Connactt Aocounting Waight Bresk Reports
1 APAX
Gost Aoctg Actoums Level (100)
1 APEZ
Cast Arzounting Devices (10)
1 APKN
Accnunt List import/Export
1 &5CC
' Sendpro C Auto 85
1 CAMR
Basic Sost Accoumbing
1 ME1A ]
: Mater Equipment - C Series
MPB1
! C Series intagrated Scale
1 PAB1 '
’ ¢ Seri=s Pramium App Bundle
1 PTJi
SendPro Online
USIETT4ES Aze Paga {af3 YiozzERI4

0 Py Bitwas e Al sights resarvatl,
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x 2n8 eondlilons




CITY OF SALEM
RESOLUTION 2021-154

AUTHORIZING REFUND OF A WATER AND SEWER OVERPAYMENT UPON
CLOSING/SETTLEMENT TRANSACTION

WHEREAS, the Estate of Elva Paras c/o Ted Paras of 164 North Union St, Block 39 lot 43 sold and
settled on the property May 14, 2021;

WHEREAS, Prior to settlement, the Title Company held from the seller, $500.00 in escrow to pay
water and sewer bill the billing cycle of the water and sewer bill range from February 1, 20121 through July
31,2021;

WHEREAS, the Title Company paid the full cycle of the in the amount of $421.18 withouta
prorated water and sewer bill;

WHEREAS, the prorated amount of the bill ranges from February 1, 2021 through May 14, 2021that
is 104 days out of 181 days for a prorated bill amount due of $242.01;

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the Salem City Council hereby authorize the :
Municipal Tax Collector and Chief Financial Officer to issue a refund in the of $179.17 to the Estate of Elva
Paras c/o Ted Paras for the overpayment made to the water and sewer account.

ATTES’I/‘: CITY OF SALEM
ot %/{ TS
Charles Bailey, Deputy Municipal Clerk Earl Gage, CouncitPresident

COUNCIL MOVED | SECONDED | Y | N | ABSTAIN | ABSENT

S. Cline X

R. Davis X

T. Gregory X X

V. Groce X

3. Kellum X X

G. Slaughter X

7. Smith X

E. Gage X

I, Charles Bailey, Deputy Municipal Clerk of the City of Salem, in the County of Salem, do hereby certify the
foregoing to be a true and correct copy of a Resolution adopted by the Common Council of the City of Salem on

July 19, 2021.
7 fo/a32] sl Z%Z
Municipal Clerk

Date Charles Bailey, Dep 7




CITY OF SALEM
.17 NEW MARKET STREET
SALEM, NYDB079

Phone: (856)935-0372
Fax: (856)935-5350

| PurchaseIOrder

| -NO 21-01236

CITY OF SALEM

WATER & SEWER DEPARTMENT
19 SOUTH FRONT 5T

SALEM, Ni 08073

ORDER DATE: 07/13/21
DELIVERY DATE:
STATE CONTRACT:
F.0.B, TERMS;
VENDOR ACCT NUM:

Vendor #: ESTOFO05

Est of ElvaParas C/O Ted Paras
110 Peachtree Lane
Landenberg, PA

4 VENDOR PHONE #:
VENDOR FAX #:

CHECK NO.

J | DATE PAID

1.00 refund overpymt oh waterfsawer
bifl closing 05/14/2021. firal water and
sewar bill attached

NOTICE TAX EXEMFT TAXID 21-6001145

1—09 78 -550-201 1'1‘9 17 00

TOTAL

Covdrad O donied 2505

Depaftment Copy
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|Govamment Recarding and Transfar Chargas

Govt recording charges

390,00

492.00,

Realty Tox Transfer Fes 1o Salem Courty Clark

2.460.60}

Non Resldent Seller Tax

iPayof(s)

Sailer - No Open Mortgages on the Property

Miscellzpanys

900,00,

Sellar's Attarney Fee tn Talsey & Telsey

Buyer's Allomney Feg to Law offices of 1es R Kramsky, LLC

480,

Adminisltative Tea 1o Law olfices of Les X Keamsky, L.LC

195,00

Docoment Frepgration tn Law offices of Les R Kramsky, LLC

500

500.00)

FErurow for Firal Weter {es) o Clty of Sslem

Survey fee |o Morgan Bnglneering & Surveying

775.00

. Bomowdr/Buyer v 1 .

. T Credl L Dablt et -
14,757.4H) 123,898,67 Subyatals 134,653.04] 124,772.0D|
Due From/To Borrowsr ' 9,881,04
109,141 6] Due From/Ta Seller
123 898.67] 123,398.67| Tatals 134.653.04) 134,653.04
Note:  POC W Pald Quiside clasing by the Boowerfduyer, PO S: Pold Oulside Cosiag by the Selar, B0 Paid by Other,
Coppighl 2005 Amerfean Luad Tie Assodistion, Pagedold File 6247-1050
All rights reserved, Biinted an {5/13/2021)




Acknowlsdgement

We/l have carefully reviewed the ALTA Settiement Statement and find It to be 2 true and acturate statement of all recelpts and
disbursements made on my atcaunt or by me bn this transaction and further certify that 1 heve received 3 copy of the ALTA Settlement
Statsment. Wefi suthorize to cause the funds to be disbursed tn accondance with this staiement,

Ta, Borrower CLINYS 4
Jsces Paras Sellex
Escrow Dfficer
Note POC B: Fild da Ch fhepsr, 1OCS: Pald dr Clslag By the Seller, PAD; Faid by Athet,
Copyright 2005 Armwrican Land THle Atroch Page Aot 4 Plle §247-1080

A rights reserved. #rinted on (5/£3/2021)




Amaritan Land Title Assoclation ALTA Sattlamant Statement - Combined
: Adopted 05-05-2015

Fiie No,/Escrow No.! 2471090

Print Date & Time: 5/13/2021 11:37:00 AM
Officer/Escrow Officer:  Classic Business Solutions, LLC

Sattlement Location: 267 Ambay Avenue, Suite 12
Metuzhen, NJ 08840

Property Address: 164 N Unlpn Strest
Zalem, NJ 0BU7S
Buryer: Taj ulien
Sellur: The Estate of Elva Paras and James Paras
Lander: Mationwide Morigage Barskers, Inc
1.oanH; 0350210361646
Settizmant Date: 5/14/2021
Disbursement Date; 5fiaf2021,

Addtiional dutes par state requirements:

Barrowei/Biyar:
- g . Gredit e . pebl .| - Creiik
Finandal
Sales Price of Proparty 123,600.00
Craposit Including samest money 1,000.00]
Loan Amount 120,772.00
123,000.00)Purchase Price
Provations/Adlustments
2158008 tankr reading 2§5.80]
62BN Clty/Town Taxes from 3/14/2021 o &/30/202) 682,87
3,000.0 Sellor Credit 3,000.00,
Loan Cherges to Natlonwide Mortgage Sarkers, Inc
Appll Feq to Nationwide Mortgage Bankers, Inc 53000
Commitment Feo to Wationwide Murtgage Bankers, Inc 1,540.00)
Brepald Home insorance Premium for 12 monihs (POC B
£797.080)10 Admisal ]
Prepaid Interem { 52.51 per day from 5/14/2021 to 6/1/2021) 171,18
| Propecty Taxes (3 mo.) (POC § §1,258.82)
Haus #0C B: PRl Qulide Chosing by the Borrowsr/Buyer, POC 52 Paid Outtida Cloalpy try b Sellez, POO; Pald by Gther.
Cogpright 2005 Amuerici Land Titke Azsoriztion. Page Laf4 flle #247-1090
Al sights raserved. Printed on {5/13/2021}




Quher Loan Charges |
Appralsal Complanee Inspection 280.60
Cradit Repart Fee 55,001
Flood Certification to Servicetink 8.00
MIP to HUD 2,077.16}
Tile Review Fex to Pulea Dellsle PLLC 350.00]
Verlfication Fee to IC3 an.d
Homeounar's Insurance $66.41 per month for 4 ma, 205.64
Property Taxes $419.60 pet mouth for 3 mo. 1,258.80|
Aggregats Adjugtmen] .41
Title Charges & Escrow / Settiamant Charges
Ttle = Landes's Title Insurancs o 24/7 Titig Sarvices 74200
Titlo— Sotilemant Agent Fec to Classio Dusiness Solutions 525.00i
THIE - Netary Fos tn Clarsic Business Sobalions 2500 .
Tills - Pholucopy BExponses t6 Clossic Busincss Soluifons 25,008
"Gille » Downlord Feo 1o Classic Business Solutions 50.00)
tl‘-‘lila -~ Qvernight Fee to Classic Business Solutions 25.00%
25.00 Title - Ousgoing Wirs to Classic Business Solutions
Title - incoming Wiro to Clessio Business Salutions 25,0
Thfe ~ Recording Servics to Classic Business Solulions 25.00[
_Eue - CSL to 24/7 Title Sorvices 25008
"Titlc ~ Exam Feo to 2447 Title Services 100,00}
Tiilo - Notice of Schlement to 24/7 Title Services 40.00)
. |Title - ALTA to 2477 Tiths Scrvicss 25.01
Title - ALTA {0 24/7 Titl= Services 25.00}
Tillc = Survey Bndarsement (o 24/7 Tille Services 25.00j
Title - Transactlor Management Fec to 2477 Title Serviess 35.00]
Tltle - Upper Courl Sasrches {o 24/7 Thle Services 43,00]
Thls - Tidatands to 24/7 Titls Services 35.00)
T ITille - Tax & Assessment Search {0 2417 Title Servioes 35.00]
Tilte - County Scarhees to 24/7 Tille Servicas 100.00}
Tille — Ownet's Tille Jnsurance (optional) to 24/7 Title Serv 35.00)
Title Tieview For 1o Law offices of Les R Kramsky, LLC 295.00
Commission
3,840.00( Realtar Commission to Keller Willlams Hometown Realty
2,478.00( Realtor Commission to First Advantage Realty
1,062.00] Co-0p AGeney Commission lo OPCITY
Noje! POC B: Pald Duttide Cosieg by the /s PRCS:F Cldlng by the Sefler, PR Peld Ty Other,
Copyeighl, 2015 Amedican kand Titla Assochition, Page 2 0f4 flic ¥247-1090
A ghts reseved, Printed on [5/13/2024}




July 13, 2021 CITY OF SALEM

03:26 PM utility Account Status By Account Id

page no: 1

Range; 705-0  te 705-0

Year: First to Last Account Type: First to Last
perfod: 1 to 12 Include prior Year/prd in Bal; Y

pate: 01/01/21 to 12/31/21 - Include zero Bal: Y

Cycla: First to Last Exclude Non-NSE Reversed Payments: N
Section: First to Last Status; Active/Inactive

Print Service Debit/Credit only:
Include Service Type: Water: Y Sewer: Y

Order By: Date
Report Type: Detail
print Block/Lot/Qual: N
Name to Print: 8111 To
Location to Print: Property

* Qverpayment amount appﬂed to periods outside the range is not displayed

Account Id  Type Section Praperty Location

811 1o Name Address

cycle ,
pate  Type  Yr/prd Code Meth Check Mo  Description Apply To Principal Interest Balance
=750 1 ROL sl 164 N UNTON ST T L L R A e

PARAS, JAMES & ELVA ESTATE 0 164 N UNTON ST SALEM NI 08079

water: 2 Sewer: 2 ' '
07/15/21 Ril1 21 2 Sewer RSI Profte Final 156.87 179.17-
07/15/21 Bill 21 2 water Rwl ProRte Final 1543679660 85.14 336.04-
07/13/21 &N 71 2 Sewer RSI Adjusted cotr c-batch 1323/24 60.09 471,18-
07/13/21 811 21 2 water Rl Adjusted reverseferr 60,09~ 481.27-
07/13/21 811} 21 2 Sewer RS1 Adjusted reverseferr 170.81- 421,18~
07/13/21 811 21 2 Sewer RSl proRte Final 110.72 250.37-
07/13/21 811 21 2 Water RWl proRte Final 1543679660 60.09 361, 00-
07/09/21 payment 21 2 Sewer 023 cx 39773 273.01- 0.00 " 421.18-
07/09/21 payment 21 2 Water 022 K 39773 148.17- 0.00 - 148.17-
07/07/21 il 21 2 water Rl Adjusted error 148.17- 0.00
07/07/21 811 21 2 Sewer RSl Adjustad error 273.01- 148.37
07/07/21 8111 21 2 Sewer RS1 ProRte Final 273.01 2118
07/07/21 Bi11 21 2 Water Wl prorte Final 1543679660 148.17 148.17
04/22/21 Payment 21 1 Sewer 023 cx 1630 273,01~ §.00 0.00
04/22/21 payment 21 1 Water 022 K 1630 148.17- 0.00 273.01
03/11/21 Bill 21 1 Sewer Rsl 273.11 421,18
03/11/21 8111 21 1 Water Rl 1543679660 148,17 148,17

prev. Bal: 0.00

HOTE: Prior Year/Period Principal I5 included on this report.




uly 13, 2021 CITY OF SALEW Page No: 1
03:25 M utility Bi11 Adjustment Entry Ver{fication Listing for Batch: KNUNEZ

gatch Td: KNUNEZ

account 14 Service Code Type Yr Prd Flat Excess Total  Descript prorate Flag Date  Seq
Name

705-0  Sever RS1 B2 2 60.03 0.00 60.00 corr c-hatch B23/24 0 O7/13721 ]
PARAS, JAMES & ELVA ESTATE OF

VARNING: Account 705-0 (Sewer, 2021, prd 2): Account has an existing Overpayment/Credit.
Use the Apply Overpayment/Transfer Credit routine to apply the credit after this Adjustment has been updated,




Page No: 2

wly 13, 2021 CITY OF SALEM
03:25 PM Utility Bi11 Adjustment Entry Totals for Batch: KNUNEZ
code # Entries Flat EXCess Total
sewer Bill RSl 1 60.09 0.00 60. 09
Total Sewar: £9.09
" Entries: 1 Total of All Codes: 50.00




(ﬂ.,) L\\”ﬁf.’é'("?—.--\ - 9’11\’2’&’2,0% f}ar/'z,a:u\

(2) a\e - sl

Slilzi— sha|

Mumi.z 2 at i
provede. B3, cloveys,

ﬁ %W‘D Frown |14 202




Jly 13, 2021 CITY OF SALEM page No: 1

03:06 po utility Bi11 Adjustment Batch Update Report
Batch: KNUNEZ  updated Billings: 2 flat: 230,90~ Exc: 0.00 pef Num: 1324
Updated Deductions: 0 Flat: 0.00 Exc: 0.00
Tota) Entries: 2 Flat: 230.90- Exc: 0,00 Total Updated: 230,90~




wly 13, 202

CITY OF SALEM
{3:06 P utility Bi11 Adjustment Entry Verification Listing for Batch: KNUNEZ

page No: 1

Batch Id: KNUNEZ

Account Id  Service Code Type Yr Prd Flat EXCess Total Descript prorate Flag Date  Seq
Name
705-0  Sewer RSl 8 21 2 170.81- 0.00 170,81~ reverse/err N 07/13/11 1
PARAS, JAMES & ELVA ESTATE OF
7050 Water miB 22 60.08- 0.00 60.09- reverse/err oM 2

PARAS, JAMES & ELVA ESTATE OF




uly 13, 2021 CITY OF SALEM ' page No: 2

03:06 PM UtiTity 811 Adjustment Entry Totals for Batch: KNUNEZ
Code # Entries Flat EXCess Total
water 8111 w1 60.09- 0,00 0.0~
Tota] water: 60.09-
Sewer Bi1l gsl i 170.81- 0.00 170.81-

Total Sewer: 170.81-
entries: | 2 Total of ATl Codes: 230.90-




page No: 1

iy 13, 2021 CITY OF SALEM
02:59 P Utility 8117 Adjustment Batch Update Report
patch: KNUNEZ  Updated Billings: 1 Flat: 421,18 Exc: 0.00 pef um: 1323

Updated Deductions: 0 Flat: 0.00 Exc: 0.00
Total Entries: ? Flat: 421.18- Exc: 0.00 Total Updated: 421.18-




nly 13, 2021 : CITY OF SALEM Page No: 1
02:58 PM stitity Bi1l Adjustment Entry yerification Listing for Batch: KNUNEZ

Batch Id: KNUNEZ

Account Id  Service tode Type Yr prd Flat EXxcess Total Descript Prorate Flag Date  Seq
Name ‘

705-0  Sewer sl e 22 273.01- 0.00 273.01- error N g7/o7/1 1
PARAS, JAMES & ELVA ESTATE OF :

7050 vater ml B 212 148.17- 0.00 148.17- error - N 2
PARAS, JAMES & ELVA ESTATE OF




uly 13, 2001 CITY OF SALEM e to: 2

02:58 P utility 8111 Adjustment Entry Totals for gatch: KNUNEZ
Code # Entries Flat EXCBSS Total
water Bill il 1 148.17- (.00 148.17-
Total Water: 148,17-
sewer Bill Rsl 1 273.01- 0.00 2713.01~
Total Sewer: 273.01-

Entries: | 2 Total of A1} Codes; 171, 18-




CITY OF SALEM
RESOLUTION 2021-155

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE REJECTION OF BIDS FOR FY2021 NJDOT
TRUST FUND RECONSTRUCTION OF 8™ STREET - PHASE 2

WHEREAS, the City advertised for bids for the FY2021 NJDOT Trust Fund Reconstruction of 8% Street ~
Phase 2; and '

WHEREAS, there were two bidders who responded; and

WHEREAS, the lowest bid substantially exceeds the City Engineer, Remington & Vernick’s estimate for the
project; and '

WHEREAS, there is a need to review the specifications for the project and re-bid; and

WHEREAS. the city desires to also advertise for bids for the FY2021 NIDOT Trust Fund Reconstruction of
8% Street — Phase 2.

NOW, THERFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the City Council of the City of Salem that the bids for the
Y2021 NIDOT Trust Fund Reconstruction of 8% Street — Phase 2 received and opened on July 13,2021 are
rejected in accordance with N.J.S.A. 40A:11-1.

ATTEST: CITY OF SALEM
L AL S

Charles Bailey, Deputjf/Municipal Clerk Earl Gage, Coundil President

COUNCIL MOVED SECONDED | Y | N | ABSTAIN ABSENT

S. Cline X

R. Davis X

T. Gregory X X

V. Groce X

S. Kellum X X

G. Slaughter X

J. Smith X

E. Gage X

1, Charles Bailey, Deputy Municipal Clerk of the City of Salem, in the County of Salem, do hereby certify the
foregoing to be a true and correct copy of a Resolution adopted by the Common Council of the City of Salem on

Juty 19, 2021,
D2/ 0/ | ..
Date Charles Bailey, Deputy-Municipal Clerk




' REMINGTON

RV E | & VERNICK
war ENGINEERS
Tuly 13, 2021
Ben Angeli, Clerk
City of Salem
17 New Market Street

Salem, NJ 08079

RVE HQ:

205% Springdale Road
Cherry Hill; N} 08003 K

O {B56) 795-9595

E: (856} 795-1882

Re: FY2021 NJDOT Trust Fund Reconstruction of 8th Street - Phase 2

Our File #17-13-T-043

Dear Mr. Angeli:

We have tabulated the bids received on July 13, 2021, with reference to the above captioned
project. The bids received are in excess of the estimate and we recommend rejection and re-

advertisement. A copy of the tabulation is enclosed for your review.

Also 'enclosed you will find the bid information of the unsuccessful bidders.

Therefore, in accordance with the Local Public Contracts Law, N.J.S.A. 40A:11-1 et seq, the
contract should be rejected. The rejection should be contingent upon approval of your solicitor.

Sincerely yours,

REMINGTON & VERNICK ENGINEERS, INC.

Anthony N. Chadwell, P.E., CM.E.

ANC/mcb

- Enclosure

cc:  NIDOT; Andrea Rhea, Esq.

rve.com




TO:

FROM:

DATE:

MEMORANDUM

Anthony Chadwell

Marie Barracliff

City of Salem

FY?2021 NJDOT Trust Fund Reconstruction of 8th Street - Phase 2
17-13-T-043

13-Jul-21

1 have reviewed the bids submitted for the above referenced project and have found no
apparent errors and/or omissions. A copy of the bid tabulation has been attached for
your review.

_ 1The list of successful bidders is as follows:

BASE BID NO.
CONTRACTOR 1 AMOUNT
Asphalt Paving Systems, Inc. $203,700.00
Think Pavers Hardscaping, LLC NO BID
, BASE BID NO.
CONTRACTOR 2 AMOUNT
Asphalt Paving Systems, Inc. - NO BID

Think Pavers Hardscaping, LLC $214,415.00




CONTRACTOR

Asphalt Paving Systems, Inc.
Think Pavers Hardscaping, LLC

CONTRACTOR

Asphalt Paving Systems, Inc.
Think Pavers Hardscaping, LLC

BASE BID NO.
3 AMOUNT

$192,400.00
NO BID

BASE BID NO.
4 AMOUNT

NO BID
$200,944.00




8 va.a 00'P66°€S

930 1 98eq

Pibanct

mOZH.Hm< D CZHHmUmm .H.mmm.m _S

SAAVINTIVE AVAVIVEIS

- 9£+07 - 00+07 VLS WOWA OSd - T# QX ASVE
TV1OL HAoTad TVIOL AOTHA SIINO & NOLLOHOSTA #
LINGD LING ALIINVND
(2= ‘S5 S0 ‘aa)) (Co ‘88 ‘SO ‘'ga))
089%-7€8 (958) 1914-19¢ (609)

19080 [N ‘TeA0 YanOE LEO80 (N “GOJUOUIIEE] e Jo A1)
Kenq3ny] sBury $T1 0£s ¥og "O°d SINFEFID
271 ‘Bmdeospref] sreaed YUM] -ouy “‘swaysAg Suiaed eqdsy £P0-L-E1-L1
. HAGWAN IOAroud
7 958G - 1990 (I8 JO UORINNSHosRy pung Isn), LOWN 120TAd
IAINVN LDAFOU
NOLLVINGVL adig

SHIAINIDONI 104l

»oineaas | A
NOLDONIWNIY




00°000°9€S

00'501%
i

" 9Jog mmnm

SIOIHL .2 ‘HSEN00 4OVAINS

el

Emlyil TVEOL ADTEL SIINA % NOLLITHDSTA
LIN LINN XLIINVAD
71 Burdesspieyy siosed JHUALL ouy ‘swayskg Fumaed yeydsy 9L+0Z - 00+01 V1S WOHA Mas T# (194 ASVH
g OoN 00'00L°c0ZE

LINN

(o2 ss ‘SO ‘ad))
089t-7c8 (959)
19080 [N ‘Tedoy JUnoW
Ky i sury ¢71
71 ‘Gurdeospref] s1aavd JUGL

MOMIO

{Co1 ‘sS ‘50 ‘dd))
191#-195 (609)
LEGZ0 [N “GojuouTEl]
0£s X0 "0'd
“ouf ‘SUIISAS Surae meydsy

T9seud

mares Jo A1D
JINATT)
£p0-L-€1-L1
HAGINON IDFC0Yd
- 1991)§ 1§ JO WOUINIEI00Y Pun ISIE LOAUIN 1202Ad
THIATVN 1DHE0UL
NOLLVINYVL did
SHAINIDONI o

»oinu3aAaz | a1 A
NOLONINIY



00 S IPYITS

ag ON

9Jo ¢ 38eg

TTVLOLANS 9L+0T - 00401 VIS WOES aE 7 QUF H5VH

£ <. WE Oaﬁmmm &) OZMNHEMM..H hm

.H<OO TATEd

ALTINVAD

NOIXArdOSIa

(910 'g$ ‘8D ‘gE))
089¥-7€8 (95%)
19080 IN ‘[edoy unopy]
AemyBryy sTary $T1
o171 ‘Burdessprey sTaseg UL

(«

99 ‘§5 “§D ‘ge)
191#-195 (609)

LEORQ [N "UOIMCTIMEE]

g ¥oqd'0'd

-guy ‘soaajsAS Suneg eqdsy

weeg Jo A1)

LLNATTD

£P0-L-E1-L1

WHGON LDACOEd

zoseud- 199135 Y13 JO BORONNSI0INY pung IS0, TOAIN 120ZA
HINYN LDACCHd

NOLLVTINGVL aId

SHIAINIDONS 1ot

soINYIAR | S AR
NOLONIWIY




910 p28eg

mqom SN0 asve E<o§oo< 7 [0S

Bl
LIND . IINA ALLINVAD
71 SudeospagE] sI9ARg UL “onf ‘sura)shs Huaeg Jeydsy 9L+07 - 00+ YT VLS WOUA OSd i4 a1d ISvY
EL AT HOTAL TVILOL AoTud SIINO ¥ NOLLIHDSEd #
JENHL . LIND ALLINVAD
(Cowe ‘58 °8D ‘g (Cor *s5 ‘5O 'ad)
089%-7€8 (958) 1914195 (609
19080 [N Tedoy ymnoW LE080 [N “Tojmourmery warEs Jo 410
AemyByy s30T STI 0£€ X082 °0'd NI
71 ‘Sundeospreg] s1ased JUML -ouy ‘smasAg Juraed egdsy eF0-Le1-L1
FAINON JIErOUd
7 9584 - 1991 T3 JO UOHONNSUOONY PUT ISIL LOWN 1Z0ZA1
THINVN LOLOUL
NOILLVINGV.L dId
SHIINIDONA tos!

soindaae | A
NOLDNIWIY



9305 9deg

_ELIS ONIIVHT) L

000023 mmnqugm AVMYAVTIE
IVLOL FONId TVLIOL TN SLINO % NOILATHOSTA . #
LINN JTINO AXLINVQAO
9L+0T - 00+T1 VIS NOH ¥qd v# QI A4SV

71 ‘Sudeospreyq sxeard JUHL

“omy ‘swayshs Sutarg eydsy

00°00¥'T61$

TYLOLINS 94407 - 00411 VLS WOUL OSd 4 Q19 HEVE

s8 mmm..DOU m0<m.mbm m.Hm.mUZOO vw

et . 111, LISOJNOD ‘STNOA nmwﬁzmﬁ
00'0r8 € 00'09% 45 ” ‘SONINMYM FTEV.IDALAA IV 00 XTVAIAIS DITENd 0
TVLOL HOTHE "IVLOL HOTAd SLINA # NOILINDSIAC #
XINO ZINA ALIILNVND
(=2 *ss ‘S0 ‘de)) (¢ ‘58 ‘s "ge)
089%-7£8 (959) 191#-19¢ (609)
19080 [N ‘T840 MO LEOSO {N “UOJIOUIIEL] waes o 41D
KenyByy sBury <71 0£S X0 "0'd NI
oy ‘Guideosprep] sxeaed JUEL “ouf ‘smia)shs Smarg eydsy Ev0-L-€I-L1
DAGANN IDArQEd
7 958Yq - 1290S Yig JO HOLONGSI0IaY PUn ISnL] JOAIN 170TA
AINVN IAP0Ud
NOILVINAVL A4
SHATNIDNI tost

>oNvaa=s | = A
NOLONINIY




00760028

930 9 aBeg

*TYIOLANS 9407 - 00+1T VLS WOHA A v# CIH ASVE

0508

%ﬁ

VAL wﬂ.ﬁmm ¥ ONIZITLA] L
T a,do&

(019 °s8 ‘80 ‘gD)
089%-7€8 (958)
19080 [N ‘TeA0 30MOTAE
Aemy3rH s3ary ¢T1
IT1 ‘Surdessprey] s1oaeg UL

(012 ‘gs ‘5D *g)
191+-19¢ (609)
LEORO [N “TOJIOTIUIBEY
0£5 ¥0€ "0'd
-ou| ‘smaysAg Jured Jreqdsy

- um[es Jo AN

LINTITD

£p0-L-€1-L1

MATWAN LIAC0Ed

7 2Ser g - 1921 |1 JO UoNInnsuosy punyg Isnil YOAIN 176744
WAVN IDAC0Ud

NOILVINGVL dId

SHIAINIDNT 1ot

M»oindaan | =l A
NOLONINIY




$ $ 3 g I
$ $ $ $ 11

$ $ $ $ 01

$ $ $ $ 6

$ $ $ $ '8

$ $ $ $ L

$ $ $ £ 9

$ $ 3 o § meIeg pEeD

$ $ $ ond $ }3oUa0,) Jonnsu0) ¥
mmb'og€ ¥ o’ $  Sth'ph€ 8 oo $ SRR UL €
o oh ehT s o S o0l '%o€ ¢ Steishg FuTARd MEqdsy ¢

$ $ $ oN 8 Bul ofElg Gmos 1

¥ "ON (19 4Svd

TONGaASYd < ONAgASvVE T ONddHASvd

JAV 00:0T @ TTET/LO AHATADTT SAId

INHTVS 40 ALLD
LATYLS g8 A0 NOLLDNAILSNOOHY

.:rﬂ LSOYL LOACN T20TA4

NOILVINIVLI AIVIAIANS

HOLOVHINOD



CITY OF SALEM
RESOLUTION 2021-156

A RESOLUTION PROVIDING FOR A MEETING NOT OPEN TO THE PUBLIC
IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE PROVISIONS OF THE NEW JERSEY
OPEN PUBLIC MEETINGS ACT, NJ SA 10:4-12 These items are for
(4) Matters pertaining to a collective bargaining agreement

WHEREAS, the Open Public Meetings Act, N.JS.A. 10:4-12b permits a public body to go info a closed
session during a public meeting to discuss certain matters as follows:
(1) Matters Required by law to be confidential: Any matter which by express provision of the Federal iaw or
State statute or rule of court shall be rendered confidential or excluded from the provisions of the Open Public
Meetings Act. '
(2) Any matter in which the release of information would impair the right to receive federal funding.
(3) Matters involving individual privacy: Any matter, the disclosure of which constitutes an unwarranted
invasion of individual privacy such as records, data, reports, recommendations or other personal material of
any education, training, social service, medical, health, custodial, child protection, rehabilitation, legal defense,
welfare, housing relocation, insurance and similar program or institution operated by a public body pertaining .
to any specific individual admitted to or served by such institution or program, including, but not limited to
information relative to the individual’s personal and family circumstances, and any material pertaining to
admission, discharge, treatment, progress or condition of any individual, unless the individual concerned .
(4) Matters pertaining to a collective bargaining agreement. Any matter involving a collective bargaining
agreement, or the terms and conditions which are proposed for inclusion in any collective bargaining
agreement, including the negotiation of the terms and conditions thereof with employees or representatives of
' employees of the public body.
- (5) Matters relating to the purchase, lease acquisition of real property or invesiment of public funds: Any
matter involving the lease, purchase or acquisition of real property with public funds, the setting of banking
rates or investment of public funds, where it could adversely affect the public interest if discussion of such
matters were disclosed.
(6) Matters of public protection. Any tactic and techniques utilized in protecting the safety and property of the
public, provided that their disclosure could impair such protection.
(7) Matters relating to litigation, negotiations and attorney-client privilege: Any matter of pending or
anticipated litigation or contract negotiation other than in (4) above in which the Board is or may become a
party. Any matters falling within the attorney-client privilege, to the extent that confidentiality s required for
the attorney to exercise ethical duties as a lawyer. '
(8) Matters relating to the employment relationship: Any matter involving the employment, appointment,
termination of employment, terms and conditions of employment, evaluation of the performance of , promotion
or disciplining of any specific prospective public officer or employee or current public officer or employee
employed or appointed by the public body, unless all of the individual employees or appointees whose rights
could be adversely affected request in writing that such matter or matters be discussed in public.
(9) Deliberations after public hearing, Deliberations by the Board occurring after a public hearing that may
result in a civil penalty or the suspension or loss of a license or permit of a responding party; and

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that it is necessary to go into a closed session to discuss certain
matters relating to the items as permitted by N.J S.A.10:4-12b




NOW, THERFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the City Council of the City of Salem that the Council will go
into closed session to discuss the following, in accordance with the aforesaid provisions of the Open Public
Meetings Act, after which it will reconvene in the public:

(4) Matters pertaining to a collective bargaining agreement
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the minutes of the closed session will be made available to the public

when the need for privacy no longer exists.

ATTEST; CITY OF SALEM
. @
/M/ Z Y,

o
Charles Bailey, Députy Municipal Clerk Earl Gage, Council President

COUNCIL MOVED SECONDED N | ABSTAIN | ABSENT
S. Cline
R. Davis
T. Gregory X
V. Groce
S. Kellum ' X
G. Slaughter
J. Smith

E. Gage

SRS PN B Rt R

I, Charles Bailey, Deputy Municipal Clerk of the City of Salem, in the County of Salem, do hereby certify thé
foregoing to be a true and correct copy of a Resolution adopted by the Common Council of the City of Salem

on July 19, 2021.
D7 e/ 202) A ég

Date Chailes Bailey, Deputy Municipal Clerk




CITY OF SALEM
RESOLUTION 2021-157

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE PART TIME EMPLOYMENT OF A
CONFIDENTIAL SECRETARY TO THE CHIEF OF POLICE

WHEREAS, the confidential secretary for the Chief of police resigned from the full time position on
June 30, 2021, and

WHEREAS, the City of Salem is seeking applicants for the position; and

WHEREAS, in the interim, the Chief has a need for a secretary and Dominique Callahan has agreed
to continue in the position on a part-time basis; and

WHEREAS, it is contemplated that the secretary will also be needed on a part-time basis for a shoﬁ
time to assist with training a new full-time secretary; and

WHEREAS, Salem City Ordinance 50-3 permits the Council to employee personnel deemed
necessary for the effective government of the force; and

WHEREAS, the position is unclassified, is not subject to the provisions of Civil Service and may be
served at the pleasure of Council.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT HEREBY RESOLVED by the Common Council of the City of
Salem, County of Salem and State of New Jersey, that Dominique Callahan shail be employed part-time in
the position of Confidential Secretary to the Chief of Police effective July 1, 2021 and shall serve at will at
the pleasure of Council.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the compensation for the employee shall be at the rate of §
per hour in accordance with the City salary ordinance.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the employee shall work hours as determined by the Chief, but
on 2 schedule that will enable the employee to train and assist the full time secretary to be hired.

ATTEST: CITY OF SALEM
4 Ao,
Charles Bailey, Depuief Municipal Clerk Earl ¢ Gage, Council President

COUNCIL MOVED SECONDED | Y | N | ABSTAIN ABSENT
S. Cline X
R. Davis X
T. Gregory X X
V. Groce X
S. Kellum X X
G. Slaughter X
J. Smith X
E. Gage X




I, Charles Bailey, D:eputy Municipal Clerk of the City of Salem, in the County of Salem, do hereby certify the
foregoing to be a true and correct copy of a Resolution adopted by the Common Council of the City of Salem

I pil

Date Charles Bailey, Deputy Municipal Clerk




RESOLUTION 2021-158

A RESOLUTION APPROVING NOTICE AND REQUEST FOR QUALIFICATIONS
RELATING TO THE SALE OF THE WATER AND WASTEWATER SYSTEMS OF
THE CITY OF SALEM

WHEREAS, the City has determined to explore the sale of its water and wastewater systems
pursuant to the authority and process set forth in the Water Infrastructure Protection Act (WIPA) N.J S.A.
58:30-5; and

WHEREAS, municipalities are authorized to sell or lease water and wastewater systems pursuant to
WIPA if emergent conditions exist as approved by the NJDEP; and

WHEREAS, in January 2021, the NJDEP approved the City’s application and found that emergent
conditions existed; and

WHEREAS, with approval granted by the NJDEP, a municipality is permitted to sell its wastewater
and water systems to a public or private utility after going through a two-stage process consisting of a
request for qualifications and request for proposals; and

WHEREAS, the City may utilize the two-step process and does not have to go through the
- referendum process as the time set forth in WIPA for parties to petition for a referendum has passed.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Common Council of the City of Salem that the
City Administrator is authorized to proceed with the sale process set forth in WIPA by utilizing the attached
form of the advertisement and Request for Qualifications. :

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that prior to advertisement, the Administrator shall provide a copy
of the proposed advertisement, request for qualifications and this Resolution to the Office of the Comptroller.
pursuant to N.J.S.A. 52:15C-10.

ATTEST: CITY OF SALEM

e Py

Charles Byailey, Deputy Municipal Clerk Earl GaggyCouncil President

COUNCIL MOVED SECONDED N | ABSTAIN ABSENT

S. Cline
R. Davis
T. Gregory X
V. Groce
S. Kellum X
G. Slaughter
J. Smith

E. Gage

kit Eaiksitaikaltailn

1, Charles Bailey, Deputy Municipal Clerk of the City of Salem, in the County of Salem, do hereby certify the
foregoing to be a true and correct copy of a Resolution adopted by the Common Council of the City of Salem on

July 19, 2021. %
g2 LS

Date Charles Béailey, Deputy;ﬁunicipal Clerk




CITY OF SALEM
RESOLUTION 2021-159

RESOLUTION EXPRESSING THE CITY COUNCIL’S SUPPORT FOR NEW
FRONTIER SOLUTIONS, LLC’S OPERATION OF A MEDICAL CANNABIS
RETAIL ESTABLISHMENT WITHIN SALEM CITY

WHEREAS, State law authorizes the use of cannabis pursuant to the New Jersey Cannabis Regulatory,
Enforcement Assistance, and Marketplace Modernization Act (the “Act”); and

WHEREAS, New Frontier Solutions, LLC (“New Frontier Solutions™) will be applying to the State of
New Jersey, Cannabis Regulatory Commission, for a license issued under the Act to operate a medical cannabis
establishment in the City of Salem during the next application period; and

WHEREAS, City of Salem Ordinance 2009 amended the Land Use Regulations to permit the
operation of medical cannabis dispensaries within the City of Salem; and

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Salem supports and encourages the safe and appropriate
siting of medical cannabis related and supported business within the City of Salem, which can further the goals
and objectives of the Master Plan as catalysts for new economic opportunities, including but not limited to;
job growth, expansion of the ratable base, and attraction of related businesses that will further spur growth.
objectives; and

WHEREAS, New Frontier Solutions is a Women-Owned Business Enterprise with pending.
certification as a Minority-Owned Business Enterprise, founded by three locally based physicians dedicated to
serving the community and spurring economic growth in Salem City; and

WHEREAS, the property proposed by New Frontier Solutions at 473 East Broadway, Salem, New
Jersey, is in an area zoned Commercial, is a minimum of one thousand (1,000) feet from any School Zone, is
not located within a Federal, State, or Local Designated Historic District, and is not within ope thousand five
hundred (1,500) feet from any other cannabis establishment; and

WHEREAS, New Frontier Solutions, LLC has pledged that it will give first hiring preference to
individuals living within the City of Salem’s geographical limits; and

WHEREAS, New Frontier Solutions, LLC will make every reasonable and legal effort to ensure that
least 51% of its employees reside within the City of Salem’s geographical limits; and

WHEREAS, New Frontier Solutions, LLC has pledged that it will give first preference to third party
contractors that reside within the City of Salem’s geographical limits and that also demonstrate hiring
preferences to individuals residing within the City of Salem’s geographical limits; and

WHEREAS, New Frontier Solutions, LLC will make every reasonable and legal effort to ensure that
Jeast 51% of its third-party contractors and their employees reside within the City of Salem’s geographical
limits;

WHEREAS, New Frontier Solutions further intends not to exclude from consideration applicants for
employment based solely on a conviction for a crime or offense involving a controlled dangerous substance or
controlled substance analog as set forth in paragraph (11) or (12) of subsection b., or subparagraph (b) of
paragraph (10) of subsection b. of N.I.S.A. 2C:35-5, ot paragraph (3) or (4) of subsection a. of N.1.S.A. 2C:35-
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10, or any similar indictable offense under federal law, State law, or any other state's law, or for any conviction
under federal law for conduct involving cannabis or a cannabis item that is authorized by P.L.2021, c. 16
(C.24:61-31 et al.).

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of Salem supports New
Frontier Solutions’ planned application to the Cannabis Regulatory Commission for a license issued under the
Act to operate a medical cannabis establishment within the City of Salem based on the items set forth in the
preamble of this Resolution; and ‘

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of Salem supports New Frontier
Solutions’ proposed location for its medical cannabis establishment at 473 East Broadway, Salem, New Jersey;
and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City of Salem shall forward a certified true copy of this
resolution to New Frontier Solutions for use in its application to the Cannabis Regulatory Commission.

BE IT FURTBER RESOLVED that the City of Salem intends for this Resolution to meet the standard
form of resolution of municipal support required as part of the licensing process by the State of New Jersey
and the City of Salem will amend this Resolution to meet the State’s form requirements without the need for.
further hearing or public notice if there is a change in the form of Resolution of support required by the State
of New Jersey after this Ordinance is adopted.

ATTEST: CITY OF SALEM
Charles Bailey, Deputy Municipal Clerk Earl Gage, CouncilBresident
COUNCIL MOVED SECONDED | Y | N | ABSTAIN ABSENT
S. Cline X
R. Davis X
T. Gregory X X
V. Groce X
S. Kellum X X
G. Slaughter X
J. Smith X
E. Gage X

I, Charles Bailey, Deputy Municipal Clerk of the City of Salem, in the County of Salem, do hereby certify the
foregoing to be a true and correct copy of a Resolution adopted by the Common Council of the City of Salem on
July 19, 2021.

’ 75@/02&92/ g%% /ﬂ/

Date Charles Bailey, Deputy Municipal Clerk
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CITY OF SALEM
RESOLUTION 2021-160

RESOLUTION TERMINATING AGREEMENT FOR VOLUNTEER AMBULANCE SERVICES
WITH FENWICK COMMUNITY AMBULANCE, INC.

WHEREAS, pursuant to City Ordinance 8-4, the City was authorized, but not required, to enter into an
agreement with a local non profit organization for the supplying of emergency and mutual aid medical
transport and related services as agreed upon; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to City Ordinance 8-5, the organization providing said volunteer services shall be
self-governed by its own bylaws and articles of incorporation so long as said operation is not in violation of
the laws of the U.S., State of New Jersey or ordinances of the City of Salem; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40:5-2, a municipality may, but is not required to make voluntary
contributions annually to the non-profit volunteer ambulance association to assist with such services; and

WHEREAS, in accordance with the ordinances of the City of Salem, the City is permitted to provide
vehicles, equipment and a building for shelter for such vehicles in its name for use by the volunteer
organization; and

WHEREAS, for many years the City of Salem has maintained such arrangement with the Fenwick
Community Ambulance, Inc. (hereinafter “Fenwick’); and

WHEREAS, due to declining membership and participation in the last several years, it became necessary for
the City to enter into an agreement with a paid ambulance service to ensure that residents of the City of
Salem had access to efficient and reliable emergency medical services; and

WHEREAS, on or about March 9, 2021, following notification that the Fenwick organization had a change
in leadership and membership the administration of the City of Salem suspended its arrangement pending the
City’s assessment of the organization’s ability to provide requisite emergency services; and

. WHEREAS, at this time, the City has determined that it is in the best interests of the City and its residents to
discontinue any agreement or arrangement with Fenwick to provide volunteer emergency medical services.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Common Council of the City of Salem that the City
terminates the agreement with the Fenwick Ambulance Corp to provide volunteer ambulance services to the
City of Salem residents and such surrounding areas.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that use by Fenwick of the City’s equipment, vehicles and building is
terminated and the City shall retain City owned equipment at this time for public use as deemed appropriate.

ATTEST: CITY OF SALEM

AL Tl 724

Charles Bailey, Depﬂﬁ Municipal Clerk Earl-éage, Council Preéga;;t




COUNCIL

MOVED

SECONDED

ABSTAIN

ABSENT

S. Cline

R. Davis

T. Gregory

V. Groce

S. Kellum

@. Slaughter

I. Smith

E. Gage
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1, Charles Bailey, Deputy Municipal Clerk of the City of Salem, in the County of S
foregoing to be a true and correct copy of a Resolution adopted by the Common Council of the City of Salem

on July 19, 2021.

07/20/202.

Date

A

alem, do hereby certify the

Charles Bailey, Def;lty Municipal Clerk




